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Darling Ethel: Of course you remember the story of the little prairie girl. I always associate it with you. Well,
again and again on this trip we would pass through prairie villages-bleak and lonely-with all the people in
from miles about to see me. Among them were dozens of young girls, often pretty, and as far as I could see
much more happy than the heroine of the story. One of them shook hands with me, and then, after much
whispering, said: "We want to shake hands with the guard!" The "guard" proved to be Roly, who was very
swell in his uniform, and whom they evidently thought much more attractive than the President... -from
"Prairie Girls" Remembered today for his expansive personality and grand sense of adventure, Theodore
Roosevelt-politician and soldier, naturalist and historian-was also a devoted, doting father and husband. This
beautiful selection of the letters he wrote to his children over the courses of their lives, as well as a few
written to other correspondents about the children, reveal a man deeply in love with his family and with the
joys of fatherhood. The tales of Christmases at the White House and whistle-stop tours through the American
countryside offer a cozy glimpse into one of the greatest American presidencies... and Roosevelt's tenderness
with his sons and daughters-as he treats them as friends, confidantes, and equals-creates a warm and intimate
portrait of one of the great American characters. Also available from Cosimo Classics: Roosevelt's A Book-
Lover's Holidays in the Open, America and the World War, Through the Brazilian Wilderness and Papers on
Natural History, Ranch Life and the Hunting Trail, The Strenuous Life: Essays and Addresses, and Historic
Towns: New York OF INTEREST TO: Roosevelt fans, readers of autobiography, students of the American
presidency American icon THEODORE ROOSEVELT (1858-1919) was 26th President of the United States,
serving from 1901 to 1909, and the first American to win a Nobel Prize, in 1906, when he was awarded the
Peace Prize for mediating the Russo-Japanese War. He is the author of 35 books.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Stanford:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or info even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming
to a person is you don't know which you should start with. This Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children
is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want
and wish in this era.

Elisa Hall:

Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of
us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge
in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article
author giving his/her effort that will put every word into enjoyment arrangement in writing Theodore
Roosevelt's Letters to His Children however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest in
addition to based confirm resource facts that maybe you can be one of it. This great information can drawn
you into brand new stage of crucial considering.

Mary Cox:

Beside this Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to
get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is
fresh in the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow community. It is
good thing to have Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children because this book offers for your
requirements readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you seldom get what it's all about.
Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss this? Find this book and read it from
at this point!

Norma Brier:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the book Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children to make
your reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading expertise is developing when you like reading. Try
to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book and reading
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that the
publication Theodore Roosevelt's Letters to His Children can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly
feel alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of that time.
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