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This book introduces the basic concepts of contact mechanics, friction, lubrication, and wear mechanisms,
providing simplified analytical relationships that are useful for quantitative assessments. Subsequently, an
overview on the main wear processes is provided, and guidelines on the most suitable design solutions for
each specific application are outlined. The final part of the text is devoted to a description of the main
materials and surface treatments specifically developed for tribological applications and to the presentation
of tribological systems of particular engineering relevance. The text is up to date with the latest
developments in the field of tribology and provides a theoretical framework to explain friction and wear
problems, together with practical tools for their resolution. The text is intended for students on Engineering
courses (both bachelor and master degrees) who must develop a sound understanding of friction, wear,
lubrication, and surface engineering, and for technicians or professionals who need to solve tribological
problems in their work.
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From reader reviews:

Austin Lawrence:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They may be
reading whatever they take because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Friction and Wear: Methodologies for Design and Control (Springer
Tracts in Mechanical Engineering).

Teresa Burns:

This book untitled Friction and Wear: Methodologies for Design and Control (Springer Tracts in Mechanical
Engineering) to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book
you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retail store or you can order
it by way of online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this
book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is no reason for you to past this book from
your list.

Mary Jacobs:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get wide
range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading books. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book you have read will
be Friction and Wear: Methodologies for Design and Control (Springer Tracts in Mechanical Engineering).

Brittany Gonzalez:

This Friction and Wear: Methodologies for Design and Control (Springer Tracts in Mechanical Engineering)
is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some information since it relief your hunger of
knowledge. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or else you who still having little
digest in reading this Friction and Wear: Methodologies for Design and Control (Springer Tracts in
Mechanical Engineering) can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this specific
book is easy to get simply by anyone. These books produce itself in the form which can be reachable by
anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in publication form make them feel
sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is not any in reading a e-book especially this one.
You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the item! Just read this e-book
type for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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