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Pro basketball player Rasheed Wallace often exclaimed the pragmatic truth “Ball don’t lie!” during a game.
It is a protest against a referee’s bad calls. But the slogan, which originated in pickup games, brings the
reality of a racialized urban playground into mainstream American popular culture. 
 
In Ball Don’t Lie!, Yago Colás traces the various forms of power at work in the intersections between
basketball and language from the game’s invention to the present day. He critiques existing popular myths
concerning the history of basketball, contextualizes them, and presents an alternative history of the sport
inspired by innovations. Colás emphasizes the creative prerogative of players and the ways in which their
innovations shape—and are shaped by—broader cultural and social phenomena.
 
Ball Don't Lie! shows that basketball cannot be reduced to a single, fixed or timeless essence but instead is a
continually evolving exhibition of physical culture that flexibly adapts to and sparks changes in American
society.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Joyner:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Ball Don't Lie: Myth,
Genealogy, and Invention in the Cultures of Basketball (Sporting). All type of book could you see on many
sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Nancy Hunt:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
simply surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this particular Ball Don't Lie: Myth,
Genealogy, and Invention in the Cultures of Basketball (Sporting) book as starter and daily reading book.
Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Loren Hatfield:

The actual book Ball Don't Lie: Myth, Genealogy, and Invention in the Cultures of Basketball (Sporting) will
bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to elucidate the idea is
very unique. Should you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Ball
Don't Lie: Myth, Genealogy, and Invention in the Cultures of Basketball (Sporting) is much recommended to
you to see. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Myron Mendez:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its protect may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside appearance
likes. Maybe you answer can be Ball Don't Lie: Myth, Genealogy, and Invention in the Cultures of
Basketball (Sporting) why because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not
disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading sixth sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.
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