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On April 11, 1981, two neighboring Palestinian Arab towns competed in a soccer match. Kafr Yassif had a
predominantly Christian population, and Julis was a predominantly Druze town. When a fight broke out
between fans, the violence quickly escalated, leaving a teenager from each town dead. In the days that
followed the game, a group from Julis retaliated with attacks on the residents of Kafr Yassif. Shihade
experienced that soccer match and the ensuing violence firsthand, leaving him plagued by questions about
why the Israeli authorities did not do more to stop the violence and what led to the conflict between these
two neighboring Arab towns. Drawing on interviews, council archives, and media reports, Shihade explores
the incident and subsequent attack on Kafr Yassif in the context of prevailing theories of ethnic and
communal conflict. He also discusses the policies of the Israeli state toward its Arab citizens. Countering
Orientalist emphases on Arab and Islamic cultures as inherently unruly and sectarian, Shihade challenges
existing theories of communal violence, highlighting the significance of colonialism's legacy, modernity, and
state structures. In addition, he breaks new ground by documenting and analyzing the use of a traditional
Arab conflict resolution method, sulha, which has received little sustained attention from scholars in the
West. Shihade opens the toolkits of anthropology, history, political science, and studies of ethnic and
communal conflict with the goals of exposing the impact of state policies on minority groups and
encouraging humane remedial principles regarding states and society.

 Download Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict A ...pdf

 Read Online Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict ...pdf

http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568
http://toolbook.site/go/read.php?id=0815632568


Download and Read Free Online Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among
Palestinians in Israel (Syracuse Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution) Magid Shihade

From reader reviews:

Rafael Arent:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among Palestinians
in Israel (Syracuse Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution). Try to face the book Not Just a Soccer Game:
Colonialism and Conflict Among Palestinians in Israel (Syracuse Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution)
as your pal. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside regarding course make
you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you far more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let's make new experience along with knowledge with
this book.

Gary Kruse:

The reserve untitled Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among Palestinians in Israel
(Syracuse Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution) is the e-book that recommended to you to study. You
can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you actually. The language that writer use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of research when write the
book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-
book of Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among Palestinians in Israel (Syracuse Studies
on Peace and Conflict Resolution) from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

James Bergeron:

The book untitled Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among Palestinians in Israel (Syracuse
Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you in the new
time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or
product, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-
book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice go through.

Adam Gutierrez:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
valuable than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you
are related is just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. On the list of
books in the top list in your reading list is usually Not Just a Soccer Game: Colonialism and Conflict Among
Palestinians in Israel (Syracuse Studies on Peace and Conflict Resolution). This book and that is qualified as
The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and review this



publication you can get many advantages.
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