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Los padres de Cristina Esquivel, una geriatra a la que han encontrado estrangulada en su piso de Madrid,
contratan al detective Arturo Zarco para que encuentre al asesino. En verdad, lo que desean, y esperan, es
que inculpe a Yalal, el albanil marroqui con el que estaba casada la muerta, y que ahora tiene la custodia de
la hija de ambos. Zarco es un detective muy poco convencional; cuarenton, gay, y aun estrechamente ligado
a Paula, su ex mujer, a la que cuenta y con la que discute por telefono las vicisitudes de la investigacion, y
hasta los pormenores de sus fascinaciones eroticas. Pero bajo la superficie de las charlas, tras el relato del ir y
venir de vecinos sospechosos y de presuntos implicados, la conversacion telefonica entre el detective y Paula
se convierte en un pretexto para la dominacion y la venganza, para el dano que se quieren infligir dos
personajes que se odian, se aman, se necesitan y se repelen. Hasta que el forcejeo dialectico entre Zarco y
Paula queda, de repente, interrumpido por el diario de la enfermedad de Luz, una de las vecinas de la geriatra
asesinada, y madre de Olmo, el jovencito que fascina y perturba a Zarco. / After the nurse Cristina Esquivel
is found strangled in her apartment in Madrid, her parents contract the private detective Arturo Zarco to find
the killer. Zarco describes the investigation to her until the struggle between them is suddenly interrupted by
the discovery the murdered womans neighbors diary. Soon one story begins to interfere with the other.
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Primeaux:

In other case, little individuals like to read book Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish
Edition). You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important any book Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish Edition). You can add expertise
and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can know
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple matter until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or searching by internet device.
It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's study.

Maurice Henkel:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone with everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a concern. What people must be consider while those
information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking seriously which one
is suitable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource then you
understand it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will not
happen throughout you if you take Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish Edition) as the daily
resource information.

Calvin Lee:

Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish Edition) can be one of your beginner books that are
good idea. We recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary that could
increase your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the
information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing
Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish Edition) however doesn't forget the main level, giving
the reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource information that maybe you can be one among it.
This great information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.

Daniel Scholz:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Black, black, black (Coleccion Compactos)
(Spanish Edition) was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Black,
black, black (Coleccion Compactos) (Spanish Edition) has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
young adults. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on
there. Therefore , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and unwind.
Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading which.
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