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Learn to pipe 100 different buttercream flowers to showcase on your cakes with this complete visual
reference to piping flowers - each flower is demonstrated on a cupcake, with five full scale projects to show
you how to combine your flowers into a masterpiece cake.

Described by Chef Duff Goldman of Ace of Cakes as "hugely aspirational yet completely approachable," the
authors demonstrate how to build up each flower using simple piping techniques that even the novice cake
decorator will be able to achieve!

All the basics are covered to get you started - how to make stable buttercream icing, advice on coloring and
flavor as well as essentials such as how to fill a piping bag and the basic techniques you need.

Valerie & Christina then demonstrate in step-by-step photographic detail how to create each flower and how
to use your new found skills to create stunning cake designs. The flowers are presented through the color
spectrum so when you look through the book you'll see the lovely rainbow effect.

Written by the world's leading lights in buttercream art with an international following and over 60,000
Facebook fans!
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Polk:

This 100 Buttercream Flowers: The Complete Step-by-Step Guide to Piping Flowers in Buttercream Icing
book is simply not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by
reading this book will be information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is
getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This 100 Buttercream Flowers: The
Complete Step-by-Step Guide to Piping Flowers in Buttercream Icing without we realize teach the one who
reading through it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry 100 Buttercream
Flowers: The Complete Step-by-Step Guide to Piping Flowers in Buttercream Icing can bring once you are
and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it within your
lovely laptop even phone. This 100 Buttercream Flowers: The Complete Step-by-Step Guide to Piping
Flowers in Buttercream Icing having excellent arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not
experience uninterested in reading.

Gary Simms:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV,
or maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you
can read a new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can
spent all day every day to reading a e-book. The book 100 Buttercream Flowers: The Complete Step-by-Step
Guide to Piping Flowers in Buttercream Icing it is rather good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough
space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from
your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Sandra Romero:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you must do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of
several books in the top list in your reading list will be 100 Buttercream Flowers: The Complete Step-by-
Step Guide to Piping Flowers in Buttercream Icing. This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides
can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upward and review this guide you can get
many advantages.

Donald Purcell:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a list of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was



exactly added. This reserve 100 Buttercream Flowers: The Complete Step-by-Step Guide to Piping Flowers
in Buttercream Icing was filled regarding science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your
scientific research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading the book. If you know how
big advantage of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like currently,
many ways to get book which you wanted.
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