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A sweeping chronicle of women's battles for reproductive freedom throughout American history, Pregnancy
and Power explores the many forces social, racial, economic, and political that have shaped women's
reproductive lives in the United States. Leading historian Rickie Solinger argues that a woman's control over
her body involves much more than the right to choose an abortion. Reproductive politics were at play when
slaveholders devised breeding schemes, when the U.S. government took Indian children from their families
in the nineteenth century, and when doctors pressed Latina women to be sterilized in the 1970s. Tracing the
diverse plot lines of women's reproductive lives throughout American history, Solinger redefines the idea of
reproductive freedom, putting race and class at the center of the effort to control sex and pregnancy in
America over time. Solinger asks which women have how many children under what circumstances, and
shows how reproductive experiences have been encouraged or coerced, rewarded or punished, honored or
exploited over the last 250 years. Viewed in this way, the debate over reproductive rights raises questions
about access to sex education and prenatal care, about housing laws, about access to citizenship, and about
which women lose children to adoption and foster care. Pregnancy and Power shows that a complete
understanding of reproductive politics must take into account the many players shaping public policy
lawmakers, educators, employers, clergy, physicians as well as the consequences for women who obey and
resist these policies. Tracing the diverse plotlines of women's reproductive lives throughout American
history, Solinger redefines the idea of reproductive freedom, putting race and class at the center of the
struggle to control sex and pregnancy in America.
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From reader reviews:

John Tibbs:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is from the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen throughout you if you take Pregnancy and Power: A Short History of Reproductive Politics in
America as your daily resource information.

Karen Strickland:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying Pregnancy and Power: A Short
History of Reproductive Politics in America that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by
reading this book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world
considerably better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading
habit only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for
every you who want to start studying as your good habit, it is possible to pick Pregnancy and Power: A Short
History of Reproductive Politics in America become your own personal starter.

George McDaniel:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of several books
in the top checklist in your reading list is Pregnancy and Power: A Short History of Reproductive Politics in
America. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in growing to be precious
person. By looking way up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Margaret Phillips:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This guide Pregnancy and Power: A Short History of Reproductive Politics in America was
filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a
book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you
wanted.
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