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Our first book, Entertaining Friends: Easy Does It with 101 Rules of Thumb, was jammed with
useful—often whimsical—information on everything from theming parties, simple suppers and sit-down
dinners, with food and drinks quantities, to table décor, flowers, candles, even conversation starters.
Houseguests? What’s to say beyond sheets, right? You might be surprised. The concept goes back at least to
the Ancient Greeks who coined the term “guest-friend” to mean the person would always be sheltered. It was
also an unspoken treaty between individuals, even those from very different cultures. In our era, entertaining
friends for an overnight or weekend is the most intimate experience one can have. Apart from sex of course
and we’re not going there! Our focus thus becomes people and places, subjects that lead to the second oldest
pastime in the history of our world: storytelling. In these pages, you will find stories about hosting and
guesting in Newport or the Cotswolds, in a West Virginia coal-mining town, on the banks of the Shannon or
in the Hudson Valley. Oh, there are rules of thumb too, 101 of them. Plus our mix of cartoons and quotes,
tips, quips, inspirations, and easy recipes for a welcoming lunch or supper. For those of us with a taste for the
macabre or outlandish behavior, we have small bites entitled The Wrong Fork, inspired by Yogi Berra’s
famous quote: When you get to the fork in the road, take it. We hope you enjoy this romp through the rules.
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From reader reviews:

Pedro Turk:

Book will be written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important matter to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book Entertaining Houseguests: 101 Rules of
Thumb for Host and Guest (Volume 2) will make you to be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if
you can know about every thing. But some of you think in which open or reading the book make you bored.
It isn't make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or acceptable
book with you?

Lauren Veach:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great and also important the book Entertaining Houseguests: 101 Rules of
Thumb for Host and Guest (Volume 2). All type of book are you able to see on many options. You can look
for the internet solutions or other social media.

John Jeanbaptiste:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic
inside the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something different
to fill your current free time/ holiday? May be reading a book may be option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the e-book untitled Entertaining Houseguests: 101 Rules of Thumb for Host
and Guest (Volume 2) can be great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Robert Vargas:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books in the
top listing in your reading list is actually Entertaining Houseguests: 101 Rules of Thumb for Host and Guest
(Volume 2). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in turning into precious
person. By looking right up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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