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Compromising Positions to Lily White--seven critically acclaimed novels, seven New York Times bestsellers.
Now, with her eighth novel, Susan Isaacs has written her finest work yet. Red, White and Bluetells the story
of two ordinary Americans who find it within themselves to become extraordinary heroes.

Charlie Blair of Wyoming and Lauren Miller of New York start out as strangers. They are drawn together by
an appalling hate crime and by their mutual passion for justice. Yet they share more than a sense of fair play.
They are not simply kindred spirits but actual kin, descendants of immigrants who met on a boat on their
way to America, in the shadow of the Statue of Liberty.

Special Agent Blair of the FBI has the numbing job of a bureaucrat and the soul of a cowboy. A wry
Westerner from his Stetson to his boots, he also happens to be the great-great-grandson of . . . Dora
Blaustein? Dora what? True, although he is unaware of that particular ancestor. A nearly burned-out case at
thirty-four, he is about to walk away from the safe world of paper-pushing to risk his life in Wyoming,
infiltrating an armed, white supremacist, viciously anti-Semitic group called Wrath. Wyoming born and bred,
Charlie seems the perfect choice for this undercover operation, because who in Wrath could question this
whiter-than-white man, so clearly one of their own?

Also in Jackson Hole is Charlie's apparent opposite. Gen-X Lauren Miller is articulate, ironic--and
unwaveringly liberal. A journalist from Long Island, she has been hired by the Jewish News to investigate a
bombing that Wrath is suspected to be behind. Lauren's job is to know who, what, where and when, of
course. But most of all, she is compelled to discover why. Why are all these people who've never met a Jew
in their lives obsessed with Jews--and why do they want them dead? Just who is it who gets to define who is
an American?

With narrative grace, insight and her trademark exuberant wit, Isaacs not only chronicles Lauren's and
Charlie's investigations, but explores their American heritage as well: How did their forebears--how did all
of our forebears--get from there to here? And what can this mountain man and this suburban woman possibly
share--except a few random genes?

Intelligent, exhilarating and intensely moving, Red, White and Blue is a novel about what makes Americans
American.
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From reader reviews:

Alvin Pryor:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication Red, White, and Blue: A
Novel will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about
every thing. But some of you think which open or reading a book make you bored. It is not make you fun.
Why they might be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or suited book with you?

Kathi Adamo:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV,
or even playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a guide. The book Red, White, and Blue: A Novel it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of
those who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough
space bringing this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the
smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book has high quality.

Yvonne Matz:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This reserve Red, White, and Blue: A Novel was filled about science. Spend your free time to
add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading some
sort of book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the
modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.

Jimmy Dolce:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and Red, White, and Blue: A Novel as
well as others sources were given knowledge for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you
feel want to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
publications are helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside science publication, any
other book likes Red, White, and Blue: A Novel to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book
like here.
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