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From Publishers Weekly: An advertising executive's jog on the beach turns into a run for his life when he is
pursued and then killed by a remote-control toy plane packed with plastique. A pretty young secretary steps
into a hotel shower and is electrocuted when she turns on the tap. Only their bizarre nature seems to link the
two crimes until LAPD's Lt. Fred Santomassimo has an equally outre thought: Could these murders be based
on the Hitchcock films North by Northwest and Psycho ? Santomassimo calls on Kay Quinn, who teaches
cinema at USC. As the gruesome Hitchcock parodies continue, Quinn advises the police on themes, motives
and settings. She proves too helpful; the killer decides to make her the star of a breathtakingly scary version
of The Birds. When Quinn escapes, her nemesis devises a more spectacular end for her. His chilling twist on
Saboteur takes them both to the Statue of Liberty, where the Hitchcock plot is given a further spin by
Professor Quinn as she too is drawn into the world of cinematic obsession. Crafted with intelligence and
suspense worthy of the master himself, this taut, sophisticated thriller will win new fans for De Felitta (
Audrey Rose ) . $80,000 ad/promo. Copyright 1991 Reed Business Information, Inc.
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From reader reviews:

Margaret Burton:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book so.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new info. When
you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of numerous ways to share the
information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make you more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the people do it
anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Funeral March, it is
possible to tells your family, friends and soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire different
ones, make them reading a publication.

Manuel Rodriguez:

The book untitled Funeral March is the book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of
the publication content that will be shown to an individual. The language that writer use to explained their
way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of research when write the
book, and so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also will get
the e-book of Funeral March from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Richard Vazquez:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite from
that. 1 activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have been
ride on and with addition details. Even you love Funeral March, you can enjoy both. It is fine combination
right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout people. What?
Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Crystal Parrish:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This Funeral March can be the answer, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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