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This eBook brings together pertinent information to help you to realize your dream of a new life, both
individually and from a family standpoint, as well as in your capacity as a business man or woman
(independent worker, entrepreneur or investor).

It includes a directory of more than 250 businesses for sale, and advice on steps to immigrate to Canada, the
presentation of each province, the services offered by Relation Canada International and life stories of
immigrants who just realized their dream.

Relation Canada International fully recognizes that it could be complicated to understand and to complete all
of the paperwork. This is why it has prepared a directory of immigration consultants. In fact, it is
recommended that you avail yourself of the services of experts when you decide to pursue your effort after
having reviewed all of the conditions for national and provincial admissibility.

In addition, Relation Canada International publish the “Guide to immigrate to Canada”. It presents the
programmes and the conditions of admissibility of the Government of Canada as well as those provinces
with established programmes and the specific criteria of these programmes. But much of the information
contained in this Guide is directed towards ordinary people, which is the case for instance with respect to
steps to go through, language tests, work visas, medical examinations, police certificates, the processes to
follow, the time required for analysis of dossiers, the request for citizenship, the control list of documents to
submit.

About
For 22 years now, he mission of Relation Canada International is to promote firms, retail establishments,
business goodwill, farms, land and lots for sale, at the provincial, national and international levels. Within
the context of the phenomenon of mass retirement of baby boomers in particular, the objective is to resolve
the problem of business succession in Quebec and in the Canadian provinces, through the promotion of
businesses available, supported by the accompaniment of sellers and buyers by experts identified on our web
site.

Through the intermediary of our web site, the print, digitized and e-book editions of our Directory of
Business Opportunities (DBO), the magazine TransActions, the Business Immigration Guide, our radio
program (CNV.ca), our buyer-seller meetings, our networks with partners as well as our business clients, we
share information on the wide variety of businesses for sale in all of the regions of Quebec, in the Canadian
provinces and now in 190 countries using this digital product.

Relations Canada International offre aujourd’hui plus de services-terrain aux vendeurs et aux acheteurs afin
to realyy reflect its new slogan : IN THE ACTION to buy, sell, invest. With no commission to pay.

A bit of history
In 1992, Relation Canada created the magazine « Terres et Terrains du Québec » with the goal of promoting
private patrimonies available for sale in Quebec. The magazine saw the light of day and the owners of golf
courses and campgrounds joined land owners to list their partnership needs or quite simply to sell through
the magazine.



Along came the Internet with the upheavals we know. The magazine became the Directory of Business
Opportunities (DBO). Relation Canada expanded through the Internet, and the magazine DBO subsequently
promoted retail establishments and firms of all types for sale, in all of the regions of Quebec. This was also
the beginning of Buyer-Seller Days, in the « speed-dating » format, organized in Montreal and in the regions.

Gradually, international relations came into being. Canadian consulates and embassies in other countries
regularly receive information on businesses for sale in Quebec. And there is a dialogue with foreign
(bilateral) chambers of commerce in Quebec. Finally, Relation Canada International offers a service of
business tourism.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Butler:

This 300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada. Volume 1 book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world
is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This
300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada. Volume 1 without we realize teach the one who reading through it
become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't end up being worry 300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada.
Volume 1 can bring if you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you
can have it with your lovely laptop even telephone. This 300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada. Volume 1
having good arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Leigh Brown:

Now a day people who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this 300 Easy ways to immigrate to
Canada. Volume 1 book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge
in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Wendell Nadeau:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will
get lot of stress from both day to day life and work. So , once we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when
the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading
textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the book you have read is
actually 300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada. Volume 1.

Sophia Hardee:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information simpler to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You will see
that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you personally is
300 Easy ways to immigrate to Canada. Volume 1 this e-book consist a lot of the information on the
condition of this world now. This particular book was represented how does the world has grown up. The
words styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he
makes this book. This is why this book appropriate all of you.
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