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Over the past 180 years scientists have sifted through evidence that at least twenty-seven human species have
evolved on planet Earth. And as you may have noticed, twenty-six of them are no longer with us, done in by
their environment, predators, disease, or the unfortunate shortcomings of their DNA. What enabled us to
survive when so many other human species were shown the evolutionary door? Last Ape Standing: The
Seven-Million-Year Story of How and Why We Survived by acclaimed science journalist Chip Walter tells the
intriguing tale of how against all odds and despite nature's brutal and capricious ways we stand here today,
the only surviving humans, and the planet's most dominant species.

Drawing on a wide variety of scientific disciplines, Walter reveals how a rare evolutionary phenomenon led
to the uniquely long childhoods that make us so resourceful and emotionally complex. He looks at why we
developed a new kind of mind and how our highly social nature has shaped our moral (and immoral)
behavior. And in exploring the traits that enabled our success, he plumbs the roots of our creativity and
investigates why we became self-aware in ways that no other animal is. Along the way, Last Ape Standing
profiles other human species who evolved with us and who have also shaped our kind in startling ways - the
Neanderthals of Europe, the "Hobbits" of Indonesia, the Denisovans of Siberia, and the recently discovered
Red Deer Cave people of China, who died off just as we stood at the brink of civilizations eleven thousand
years ago.

Last Ape Standing is an engaging and accessible story that explores the forces that molded us into the
peculiar and astonishing creature that we are.
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From reader reviews:

Janice Perry:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A guide Last Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-
Year Story of How and Why We Survived will make you to be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence
if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading any book make you
bored. It's not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book
with you?

Mary Young:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information
better to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, magazine,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended for your requirements is Last Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-Year Story of How and
Why We Survived this publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. That
book was represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain
it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this
book suitable all of you.

Kori Pierson:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This Last Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-Year Story of How and
Why We Survived can give you a lot of friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have point
that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for
you to get success. This publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by
knowing more than different make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We need to have Last
Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-Year Story of How and Why We Survived.

Shelly Reder:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book Last Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-Year
Story of How and Why We Survived was colorful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know
that book Last Ape Standing: The Seven-Million-Year Story of How and Why We Survived has many kinds
or genre. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read
and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are generally make you bored,
any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and try to like



reading that.
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