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When Ken Brennan was classified 4-F “the registrant is not acceptable for military service” due to a
childhood leg injury, he joined the American Field Service, a group of volunteers who drove Red Cross
ambulances for the British Army during World War II. Told through vivid diaries and letters Ken wrote from
1942 until 1945, he chronicles how he battled dysentery, dodged mine fields, sought safety from German
bombing raids, and negotiated Italy’s snowy Apennine Mountain passes to carry wounded soldiers from field
hospital tents. Ken’s unique first-hand account of an important part of WWII history reminds us of how
selfless service and untold sacrifices were made by those men who performed the crucial role of rescuing
soldiers and bringing them to safety during the war.
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From reader reviews:

Ashley Taylor:

The book Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII Ambulance Driver gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You should use to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your
best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with your subject. If you can make looking at a
book Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII Ambulance Driver to be your habit, you can get more
advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You
could know everything if you like open and read a publication Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII
Ambulance Driver. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other
people. So , how do you think about this guide?

Ila Robinette:

Often the book Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII Ambulance Driver has a lot info on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was authored by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read
you will get the point easily after looking over this book.

Marlon Duenas:

Why? Because this Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII Ambulance Driver is an unordinary book
that the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside.
Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the book in such remarkable way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This amazing book will
give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have got such as help improving your expertise and
your critical thinking method. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the
book store hurriedly.

Jesus Moreno:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is named
of book Death Before Dishonor: Memoirs of a WWII Ambulance Driver. You can include your knowledge
by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is
most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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