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Fat Cat Stories are designed to help children with dyslexia, moderate learning difficulties or English as an
additional language learn to read.
The books work best together with a holistic programme, which is still in development, but in the meantime
the books are available for those who want to start using them. The books are designed to teach one word
family at a time. They use a great deal of repetition. Each book builds on the next book and this makes it
possible to go at the child's pace. Some children will need to read each book in order to get as much practice
and repetition as possible. Other children will be able to read every second book or every third book. It is not
recommended that more than four word families are taught at any one time. The books start off very easy
with two and three letter words in order for children to experience success in reading. This in turn builds
confidence and self-esteem.
Dyslexia is complex as many different issues can cause it. These books are designed to deal with as many
issues as possible, including sequential processing issues, working memory issues and some aspects of visual
processing. For children, who are struggling to read because of language issues or visual processing issues,
they will need a professional programme to support them with these. These books can still be used together
with that programme, but will not be sufficient on their own. These books are also designed for children who
have learned their basic letter-sound correspondences, but are still struggling to use phonics for reading and
spelling.
Instructions on how to use the books are at the back of each book.
I am an Educational Psychologist and a Learning Support Specialist and have used these books to teach
children with reading difficulties. I wanted to create a resource for teachers and parents which they can use
on their own to help children struggling to read. I do not claim that these books will 'cure' a reading
difficulty. These books are part of a wider series, which is still in development. I will place an update on
Amazon when more books and resources are available.
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From reader reviews:

John Lyons:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can realize everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A publication Fat Cat Stories Level 1 Book 10 ut Word Family
will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But
some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why
they may be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suitable book with you?

Joanna Weekley:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information due to the fact book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading through a book will make an
individual more imaginative. When you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring that you
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this Fat Cat Stories Level 1 Book 10 ut Word Family, you may tells your family,
friends in addition to soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a
publication.

Deborah Anderson:

The book untitled Fat Cat Stories Level 1 Book 10 ut Word Family is the guide that recommended to you to
study. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The language
that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when
write the book, so the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-
book of Fat Cat Stories Level 1 Book 10 ut Word Family from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy
free time.

Erika Yoon:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to you
is Fat Cat Stories Level 1 Book 10 ut Word Family this book consist a lot of the information in the condition
of this world now. This book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles
that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some research when he makes this
book. This is why this book suitable all of you.
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