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Mass Customization examines the business opportunities, considerations, and challenges manufacturers in
various industries must weigh before committing to the significant investment in machinery and software
needed to go to mass customization. For manufacturers who decide that it’s time to take the plunge, the
author describes the proven methods and latest technologies for making mass customization work seamlessly
and profitably on the factory floor.

Mass customization—the automated manufacturing bespoke products, profitably combining the low unit
costs of mass production with the flexibility of building custom products to order—has been touted as the
next big thing for more than a quarter of a century. Until recently, however, mass customization made only
modest inroads in a few industries. Now, the convergence of new ICT and manufacturing technologies with
traditional CNC technologies means that mass customization’s moment has arrived for breaking out into a
wide range of industries.

Hans Kull is an engineer and mathematician who applies his expertise in combinatorial optimization,
programming, and engineering to devising end-to-end automated solutions for mass customization,
automating and optimizing all processes—from bespoke parts supply, order processing, production, and
waste minimization to packing and delivery. He shares with his readers practical lessons for making mass
customization succeed, case studies from various industries, and an insider’s vision of the business
implications of mass customization’s coming of age.
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From reader reviews:

Hazel Park:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world can share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they
write about the information about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your kids, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try
to improve their proficiency in writing, they also doing some analysis before they write for their book. One
of them is this Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and Challenges for Manufacturers.

Brett Baker:

This Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and Challenges for Manufacturers is great book for you
because the content which can be full of information for you who always deal with world and possess to
make decision every minute. That book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we can
point out no rambling sentences included. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole details in
it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with wonderful
delivering sentences. Having Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and Challenges for
Manufacturers in your hand like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one
particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world within ten or fifteen moment right but this
reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt
which?

Bruce Delvalle:

Beside this kind of Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and Challenges for Manufacturers in your
phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the
knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged
people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and
Challenges for Manufacturers because this book offers for you readable information. Do you oftentimes have
book but you seldom get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in your hand.
The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques
you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from right now!

Angela Souther:

A lot of e-book has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of
book Mass Customization: Opportunities, Methods, and Challenges for Manufacturers. You can include your



knowledge by it. Without departing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make a person happier
to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one place to other
place.
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