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Thoroughly updated for its Second Edition, this practical guide will aid residents and clinicians in diagnosing
and treating the full spectrum of mood disorders. Using the conversational style and clinical vignettes found
in all Practical Guides in Psychiatry titles, Dr. Ghaemi explains how to accurately diagnose unipolar
depression and bipolar disorder and offers specific, detailed, evidence-based recommendations on
pharmacotherapy and psychotherapy.

Chapters review the pharmacology of all antidepressants, mood stabilizers, and antipsychotics in current use
and point out these drugs' advantages and drawbacks in specific clinical situations. Other chapters address
clinical problems such as depression, mania, and ADHD in children and the conundrum of schizoaffective
disorder.

The Practical Guides in Psychiatry series provides quick, concise information for professionals on the front
lines of mental health care. Written in an easy-to-read, conversational style, these invaluable resources take
you through each step of the psychiatric care process, delivering fast facts and helpful strategies that help
you provide effective and compassionate care to your patients.
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From reader reviews:

Lea Severino:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading habit give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside the book in which
improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of publication you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy read one
using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Often the Mood Disorders: A Practical Guide (Practical
Guides in Psychiatry) is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Kevin Roark:

This book untitled Mood Disorders: A Practical Guide (Practical Guides in Psychiatry) to be one of several
books that will best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot
of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it through
online. The publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can
read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Mark McKinney:

Why? Because this Mood Disorders: A Practical Guide (Practical Guides in Psychiatry) is an unordinary
book that the inside of the publication waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with the
secret the idea inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
amazing way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining approach but still convey the
meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it.
This excellent book will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your
expertise and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I were being
you I will go to the guide store hurriedly.

Margarita Culbertson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or even make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's soul or real their leisure
activity. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring along with can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Mood Disorders: A Practical Guide (Practical Guides in
Psychiatry) can make you really feel more interested to read.
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